

**LEE COUNTY HYACINTH CONTROL DISTRICT**  
**AWARDED BID TABULATION**  
**CALENDAR YEAR 2019**

**AWARDED BID \***

<b>CARFENTRAZONE-ETHYL</b>				
<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>PRODUCT</b>	<b>CONTAINER SIZE</b>	<b>PRICE</b>	
NUTRIEN	STINGRAY	QUART	\$156.20	QT
		GALLON	N/A	GL
ALLIGARE, LLC	NO BID	QUART	\$0.00	QT
		GALLON	\$0.00	GL
<b>HELENA</b>	<b>STINGRAY</b>	<b>QUART</b>	<b>\$153.14</b>	<b>QT</b>
		<b>GALLON</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>GL</b>

<b>COPPER-ETHYLENEDIAMINE COMPLEX</b>				
<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>PRODUCT</b>	<b>CONTAINER SIZE</b>	<b>PRICE</b>	
NUTRIEN	KOMEEN	2.5 GALLON	\$29.60	/GL
		275 GALLON TOTE	\$23.29	/GL
ALLIGARE, LLC	NO BID	2.5 GALLON	N/A	/GL
		275 GALLON TOTE	N/A	/GL
<b>HELENA</b>	<b>KOMEEN</b>	<b>2.5 GALLON</b>	<b>\$29.02</b>	<b>/GL</b>
		<b>275 GALLON TOTE</b>	<b>\$22.39</b>	<b>/GL</b>

<b>CUTRINE PLUS</b>				
<b>VENDOR</b>	<b>PRODUCT</b>	<b>CONTAINER SIZE</b>	<b>PRICE</b>	
NUTRIEN	CUTRINE PLUS FL 909	2.5 GALLON	\$15.08	/GL
		275 GALLON TOTE	\$14.48	/GL
<b>ALLIGARE, LLC</b>	<b>ARGOS</b>	<b>2.5 GALLON</b>	<b>\$13.90</b>	<b>/GL</b>
		<b>275 GALLON TOTE</b>	<b>\$13.50</b>	<b>/GL</b>
HELENA	CUTRINE PLUS FL 909	2.5 GALLON	\$15.50	/GL
		275 GALLON TOTE	N/A	/GL

**LEE COUNTY HYACINTH CONTROL DISTRICT**  
**AWARDED BID TABULATION**  
**CALENDAR YEAR 2019**

**DIQUAT DIBROMIDE**

VENDOR	PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	PRICE
NUTRIEN	TRIBUNE	2.5 GALLON	\$41.80 /GL
<b>ALLIGARE,LLC</b>	<b>ALLIGARE DIQUAT</b>	<b>2.5 GALLON</b>	<b>\$39.90 /GL</b>
HELENA	TRIBUNE	2.5 GALLON	\$40.10 /GL

**FLUMIOXAZIN**

VENDOR	PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	PRICE
<b>NUTRIEN</b>	<b>CLIPPER SC</b>	<b>1 GALLON</b>	<b>\$690.00 /GL</b>
ALLIGARE,LLC	NO BID	1 GALLON	N/A /GL
HELENA	SEMERA	1 GALLON	\$82.00 /LB

**GLYPHOSATE**

VENDOR	PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	PRICE
NUTRIEN	AQUANEAT	2.5 GALLON	\$16.00 /GL
<b>ALLIGARE,LLC</b>	<b>ALIGARE,LLC</b>	<b>2.5 GALLON</b>	<b>\$15.40 /GL</b>
HELENA	ROUND UP CUSTOM	2.5 GALLON	\$16.50 /GL

**IMAZAMOX**

VENDOR	PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	PRICE
NUTRIEN	CLEARCAST	1 GALLON	\$276.54 /GL
<b>ALLIGARE,LLC</b>	<b>IMOX</b>	<b>1 GALLON</b>	<b>\$233.00 /GL</b>
HELENA	CLEARCAST	1 GALLON	\$276.54 /GL

**\*\*NEW**

**KOMEEN CRYSTAL**

VENDOR	PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	PRICE
NUTRIEN	KOMEEN CRYSTAL	20 POUND PAIL	\$12.14 /LB
ALLIGARE,LLC	NO BID	20 POUND PAIL	N/A /LB
<b>HELENA</b>	<b>KOMEEN CRYSTAL</b>	<b>20 POUND PAIL</b>	<b>\$11.78 /LB</b>

**LEE COUNTY HYACINTH CONTROL DISTRICT**  
**AWARDED BID TABULATION**  
**CALENDAR YEAR 2019**

**LOVERT INVERTING OIL**

VENDOR	PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	PRICE
NUTRIEN	LOVERT	2.5 GALLON	\$16.49 /GL
ALLIGARE,LLC	NO BID	2.5 GALLON	N/A /GL
<b>HELENA</b>	<b>LOVERT</b>	<b>2.5 GALLON</b>	<b>\$16.42 /GL</b>

**BREEZE**

VENDOR	PRODUCT	CONTAINER SIZE	PRICE
NUTRIEN	NO BID	2.5 GALLON	N/A /GL
ALLIGARE,LLC	NO BID	2.5 GALLON	N/A /GL
<b>HELENA</b>	<b>INLET</b>	<b>2.5 GALLON</b>	<b>\$12.80 /GL</b>

**BREEZE (LABEL SPECIFIC)**

**\*\* IMOX IS A NEW PRDUCT TO US, AND WILL BE SAMPLED BEFOR PURCHASED \*\***