

LEE COUNTY HYACINTH CONTROL DISTRICT
ITB 22-102 ANNUAL HERBICIDES
BID RESULTS

VENDOR	Est Qty	UOM	Unit Cost	Per	Ext Cost
KOMEEN					
A.S. Nutrien	550	275 GAL TOTE	\$26.230	GAL (TOTE)	\$14,426.50
A.S. Nutrien	550	2.5 GAL JUG	\$32.890	GAL (JUG)	\$18,089.50
A.S. Winfield United	550	275 GAL TOTE	\$26.230	GAL (TOTE)	\$14,426.50
A.S. Winfield United	550	2.5 GAL JUG	\$32.890	GAL (JUG)	\$18,089.50
A.S. Helena	550	275 GAL TOTE	\$26.230	GAL (TOTE)	\$14,426.50
A.S. Helena	550	2.5 GAL JUG	\$32.890	GAL (JUG)	\$18,089.50
Alligare	550	275 GAL TOTE	NO BID		
Alligare	550	2.5 GAL JUG	NO BID		NO BID
CUTRINE PLUS					
Nutrien	500	250 GAL TOTE	\$24.500	GAL (TOTE)	\$12,250.00
Winfield United	500	250 GAL TOTE	\$25.880	GAL (TOTE)	\$12,940.00
Helena	500	250 GAL TOTE	\$28.250	GAL (TOTE)	\$14,125.00
Alligare	500	250 GAL TOTE	NO BID		
KOMEEN CRYSTAL					
Nutrien	300	20 LB BAG	NO BID		
Winfield United	300	20 LB BAG	NO BID		
Helena	300	20 LB BAG	NO BID		
Alligare	300	20 LB BAG	NO BID		
CUTRINE PLUS GRANULAR					
Nutrien	300	30 LB BAG	\$2.350	Pound	\$705.00
Winfield United	300	30 LB BAG	\$2.750	Pound	\$825.00
Helena	300	30 LB BAG	\$2.590	Pound	\$777.00
Alligare	300	30 LB BAG			
HARPOON GRANULAR					
Nutrien	2000	40 LB BAG	\$2.250	Pound	\$4,500.00
Winfield United	2000	40 LB BAG	\$2.700	Pound	\$5,400.00
Helena	2000	40 LB BAG	\$2.10625	Pound	\$4,212.50
Alligare	2000	40 LB BAG	NO BID		
LOVERT					
Nutrien	500	250 GAL TOTE	\$17.850	GAL (TOTE)	\$8,925.00
Nutrien	500	2.5 GAL JUG	\$19.100	GAL (JUG)	\$9,550.00
Winfield United	500	250 GAL TOTE	\$19.990	GAL (TOTE)	\$9,995.00
Winfield United	500	2.5 GAL JUG	\$21.960	GAL (JUG)	\$10,980.00
Helena	500	250 GAL TOTE	\$16.400	GAL (TOTE)	\$8,200.00
Helena	500	2.5 GAL JUG	\$17.250	GAL (JUG)	\$8,625.00
Alligare	500	250	NO BID		
Alligare	500	2.5 GAL JUG	NO BID		

NO BID
DOES NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS
WINNING BID
AGENCY SET PRICE

[Signature] 10/21/21
 Executive Director Date
[Signature] 10/21/21
 Chief Financial Officer Date
[Signature] 10/21/21
 Deputy Director Date
[Signature] 10/21/21
 Board Member Date